2024 SUMMARY OF RFP RESPONSES BASED ON CURRENT BANDWIDTH

Public Internet Services Bandwidth Comcast | PSLightwave | Sparklight Btel LightStream
Location Public Dedicated Price Price Price Price Price

Award to: Internet Access

BTEL Brazoria Library 620 S. Brooks, Brazoria, TX 77422 100 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid $650.00 No Bid
Comcast Alvin Library 105 South Gordon, Alvin, TX 77511 1 Gbps $1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Comcast Angleton Library 401 E. Cedar, Angleton, TX 77515 1 Gbps $1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Comcast Clute Library 215 N. Shanks, Clute, TX 77531 100 Mbps $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00
Comcast Freeport Library 410 Brazosport Blvd., Freeport, TX 77541 100 Mbps $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00
Comcast Lake Jackson Library 250 Circle Way, Lake Jackson, TX 77566 1 Gbps $1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,200.00
Comcast Manvel Library 20514B Hwy 6, Manvel, TX 77578 100 Mbps $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Comcast Pearland Library 3522 Liberty Drive, Pearland, TX 77581 1 Gbps $1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Comcast West Pearland Library 11801 Shadow Creek Pkwy, Pearland, TX 77584 1Gpbs $1,425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sparklight Danbury Library 1702 North Main, Danbury, TX 77534 50 Mpbs $450.00 No Bid $355.00 No Bid No Bid
Sparklight  [Sweeny Library 205 W. Ashley Wilson, Sweeny, TX 77480 100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 $500.00 No Bid
Sparklight  [West Columbia Library 518 E. Brazos, West Columbia, TX 77486 100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 $925.00 No Bid




Staff Data Services Comcast
Location Z (for PTP Staff Data
Award to: Location A and Metro E) Bandwidth PtP Price Metro-E Price DIA Price Alternate Option
Data Center (Metro-E Only) Host 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
. 77515 1Gb .
Comcast Port 237 E. Locust, Angleton TX PG ps N/A $675.00 N/A No Bid
. . 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Comcast Alvin Library 105 South Gordon, Alvin, TX 77511 - 20Mbps N/A $250.00 N/A No Bid
. 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Comcast Angleton Library 401 E. Cedar, Angleton, TX 77515 TX 77515 50Mbps N/A $285.00 N/A No Bid
. 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Comcast  |Clute Library 215 N. Shanks, Clute, TX 77531 X 77515 20Mbps N/A $250.00 N/A No Bid
. 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Comcast Freeport Library 410 Brazosport Blvd., Freeport, TX 77541 TX 77515 20Mbps N/A $250.00 N/A No Bid
. . 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Comcast Lake Jackson Library 250 Circle Way, Lake Jackson, TX 77566 I — 20Mbps N/A $250.00 N/A No Bid
. 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Comcast  |Manvel Library 20514B Hwy 6, Manvel, TX 77578 X 77515 20Mbps N/A $250.00 N/A No Bid
. . . 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Comcast Pearland Library 3522 Liberty Drive, Pearland, TX 77581 — 20Mbps N/A $250.00 N/A No Bid
. 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
e West Pearland Library 11801 Shadow Creek Pkwy, Pearland, TX 77584 X 77515 20Mbps N/A $250.00 N/A No Bid
Danbury Libray 1702 North Main, Danbury, TX 77534 ii77E7'5LfSCUSt' Angleton 10 Mbps N/A $240.00 N/A No Bid
Staff Data Services SparkLight
Location Z (for PTP
Award to: Location A and Metro E) Bandwidth PtP Price Metro-E Price DIA Price Alternate Option
. . 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
SroErldis Danbury Library 1702 North Main, Danbury, TX 77534 . 10Mbps $320.00 NA $235.00 No Bid
. . 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Stz Sweeny Library 205 W. Ashley Wilson, Sweeny, TX 77480 X 77515 10Mbps $320.00 NA $235.00 No Bid
- . 237 E. Locust, Angleton .
Stz West Columbia Library 518 E. Brazos, West Columbia, TX 77486 X 77515 10Mbps $320.00 NA $235.00 No Bid
Staff Data Services BTEL
Location Z (for PTP
Award to: Location A and Metro E) Bandwidth PtP Price Metro-E Price DIA Price Alternate Option
. . 237 E. Locust, Angleton . . .
. 100 Mb .
BTEL Brazoria Library 620 S. Brooks, Brazoria, TX 77422 o e ps No Bid No Bid $275.00 No Bid
Sweeny Library 205 W. Ashley Wilson, Sweeny, TX 77480 _zr)3(77E7'5L55CUSt' Angleton 10Mbps No Bid No Bid $150.00 No Bid
West Columbia Library 518 E. Brazos, West Columbia, TX 77486 $i77E7'5L;’5C“St' Angleton 10Mbps No Bid No Bid $150.00 No Bid
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