BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB # 25-37 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

ACC Houston LLC dba Arcosa Crushed
OPEN DATE RESPONDENT'S NAME Concrete Vulcan Materials Vernor Materials and Eauipment Co. Inc.
APRIL 08, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6131 Selinsk 10101 Reunion PI, Suite 500 545 Wilson Road.
LOCATION: Houston, TX 77048 San Antonio, TX 78216 Freeport, TX 77541
PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Lisa Sheffield Melanie Marrigue Ross Garcia
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 713-436-0990 210-965-0449 979-233-3366
| ANGLETON. TX 77515 FAX NUMBER:
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS. NAVE: TELEPHONE NAWEE: TELEPHONE NAWEE: TELEPHONE NAWEE: TELEPHONE
Lisa Shefield 281.979-1775 Tvier Wheeland 3463759654 |Lisa Deleon 9792336330
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES: NAVE: TELEPHONE NAVEE: TELEPHONE NAVE: TELEPHONE NAWEE: TELEPHONE
Lisa Sheffield 2819791775 Jennifer Flaoa 2108602597 | Valerie Moreno 979233-3366
BIDDER PLANT LOCATION: (If vendor has multiple locations, the vendor must complete this section for
MILEAGE FROM PLANT
LOCATION OF PLANT COUNTY FACILITY e St e,
irpor
8000 Airport Way
Andleton. TX 77515 36 20 miles 14
North Service Center
2508 North Gordon Street
| Alvin, TX 77511 20 42 miles 40
Central Service Center
21017 CR 17
Andleton. TX 77515 35 19 miles 15
Camp Mohawk
110 CR 193
Alvin, TX 77511 30 32 miles 28
South Service Center
1432 Highland Park Drive
Clute. TX 77531 48 9 miles 1
Hanson Riverside Park
18499 Hwy 35
West Columbia. TX 77486 46 29 miles 25
Manvel Service Center
7315 Corporate Drive
[Manve. T 77578 11 34 miles 38
Mosquito Control
1380 East Kiber Street
| Analeton. TX 77515 36 18 miles 14
Quintana County Park
330 5th Street
Quintana. TX 77541 56 7 miles 11
Resoft Park
349 CR 281
Alvin, TX 77511 2 30 miles 36
San Luis County Park
14001 CR 257
Freeport, TX 77541 66 21 miles 20
West Service Center
411 N. 10th Street
West Columbia. TX 7784 43 33 miles 25
fice) 17833 SH 35, West
Columbia, TX 77486 48 28 miles 29
PRICE PER TON LOADED
DESCRIPTION COUNTY ID # e
FLEXIBLE BASE
CRUSHED LIMESTONE - PER TxDOT ITEM 247. TYPE A. GRADE 1 6745] No Bid $39.00 $56.00
PLANT LOCATION
COUNTY FACILITY. PRICE PER TON DELIVERED TO COUNTY FACILITY
[AIRPORT o 546 S64.
NORTH SERVICE CENTER o 50 573
[CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER o S64.
[CAMP MOHAWK o 568
[SOUTH SERVICE CENTER o $59
[HANSON RIVERSIDE PARK o 567
MANVEL SERVICE CENTER o S72.
MOSQUITO CONTROL o 64
[QUINTANA COUNTY PARK o S63.
[RESOFT COUNTY PARK o s71
[SAN LUIS COUNTY PARK o S66.
WEST SERVICE CENTER o 567
HANSON BEAL RANCH PARK (Host Office) o S67.
[PRICE PER TON AS DELIVERED TO JOBSITE No Bid $39.00 $56.00
HAULING FIRST MILE No Bid $5.20 53,50
[HAULING EACH ADDITIONAL MILE No Bid 50.25 5035
[MINIMUM TRUCKLOAD (if reauired) No Bid 24 Ton 74 Ton
PRICE PER TON LOADED
DESCRIPTION COUNTY ID # e n e
RECLAIMED BASE BLEND
[Agaregate shall consist of crushed concrete, crushed limestone, gravel,
andlor shell, mixed with sand, meeting the gradation, liquid limit, and
plasticity index requirements of TXDOT ltem 247, Type D, Grade 1 6746
Reclaimed materials shall be free of foreign matter such as crushed
glass, steel fragments, and petroleum contaminants, and shall contain
not more than five (5) bercent by volume crushed brick 714 No Bid $35.00
PLANT LOCATION
COUNTY FACILITY PRICE PER TON DELIVERED TO COUNTY FACILITY
[AIRPORT 540 o 543
NORTH SERVICE CENTER 536 o 52
[CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER 539 o 543
[CAMP MOHAWK 538 o 47
[SOUTH SERVICE CENTER 543 o 36
[HANSON RIVERSIDE PARK 542 o 546
MANVEL SERVICE CENTER 533 o 54
MOSQUITO CONTROL 540 o 543
[QUINTANA COUNTY PARK $45 o 542
[RESOFT COUNTY PARK 536 o 550
[SAN LUIS COUNTY PARK 547 o $45
WEST SERVICE CENTER Sa1 o 546
HANSON BEAL RANCH PARK (Host Office) 543 o S46
[PRICE PER TON AS DELIVERED TO JOBSITE 527.00 No Bid $35.00
HAULING FIRST MILE 54.25 No Bid 53,50
[HAULING EACH ADDITIONAL MILE 50.25 No Bid 035
[MINIMUM TRUCKLOAD (if required) 15 Ton No Bid 74 Tons
PRICE PER TON LOADED
DESCRIPTION COUNTY ID # e n R
CRUSHED CONCRETE
[Aggregate shall consist of reclaimed crushed concrete meefing the
gradation, liquid limit, and plasticity index requirements of TXDOT ltem
247, Type D, Grade 1. Reclaimed material shall be free of foreign matter 6747
such as crushed glass, steel fragments, and petroleum contaminants of
unknown comoosition $27.00 No Bid $35.00
PLANT LOCATION
COUNTY FACILITY. PRICE PER TON DELIVERED TO COUNTY FACILITY
AR 540 o 543
NORTH SERVICE CENTER 536 o S52.
(CENTRAL SERVICE CENTER 539 o 543
[CAMP MOHAWK 538 o S47
[SOUTH SERVICE CENTER 543 o 538
[HANSON RIVERSIDE PARK 542 o 546
MANVEL SERVICE CENTER 533 o 51
MOSQUITO CONTROL 540 o 543
[QUINTANA COUNTY PARK 545 o 542
[RESOFT COUNTY PARK 536 o S50
[SAN LUIS COUNTY PARK 547 o 545
WEST SERVICE CENTER ] o S46
HANSON BEAL RANCH PARK (Host Office) 543 o 546
PRICE PER TON AS DELIVERED TO JOBSITE 527.00 No Bid §35.00
[HAULING FIRST MILE 54.25 No Bid $3.50
HAULING EACH ADDITIONAL MILE 50.25 No Bid 50.35
MINIMUM TRUCKLOAD (if required) 15 Ton No Bid 74 Tons
PRICE PER TON LOADED
DESCRIPTION COUNTY ID # e
CRUSHED ASPHALT - RAP
Aggregate shall consist of reclaimed crushed asphall meeting the
gradation, liquid limit, and plasticity index requirements of TXDOT ltem
247, Type D Grade 1. Reclaimed material shall be free of oreign mater 6748
such as crushed glass, steel fragments, and petroleum contaminants of
unknown comoosition $27.00 No Bid $45.00
PLANT LOCATION
COUNTY FACILITY PRICE PER TON DELIVERED TO COUNTY FACILITY
540 o $53
536 o 562
539 o $53
538 o $57.
543 o S48
542 o 556
533 o $61
540 o 553
$45 o S52.
536 o 560
547 o $55
Sa1 o 556
HANSON BEAL RANCH PARK (Host Office) 543 o $56
[PRICE PER TON AS DELIVERED TO JOBSITE $27.00 No Bid $45.00
HAULING FIRST MILE 54.25 No Bid 53,50
[HAULING EACH ADDITIONAL MILE 50.25 No Bid 035
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ITB # 25-37 ROAD MATERIALS - FLEXIBLE BASE

ACC Houston LLC dba Arcosa Crushed

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Concrete Vulcan Materials Vernor Materials and Eauibment Co. Inc.
[APRIL 08, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6131 Selinsky 10101 Reunion P, Suite 500 545 Wilson Road.

LOCATION: Houston, TX 77048 San Antonio, TX 78216 Freeport, TX 77541
PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Lisa Sheffield Melanie Marrigue Ross Garcia

237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 713-436-0990 210-965-0449 979-233-3366

ANGLETON. TX 77515 FAX NUMBER:

[MINIMUM TRUCKLOAD (i required) 15 Ton No Bid 4 Tons
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