
BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
DESCRIPTION:

1.1.  D3K XL CAT, JOHN DEERE 450J OR 
EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $750.00 $721.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,199.00 $1,909.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $5,550.00 $4,730.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE 650M
250-1140 DOZER WIDE TRACK 70-85 HP ROPS JOHN DEERE 450K or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER 70-85 HP

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 78

RENTAL LOCATIONS IN BRAZORIA COUNTY 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY- Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

1.2  D4K XL CAT, KOMATSU D37PX OR 
EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,250.00 $875.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,700.00 $2,338.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $7,985.00 $5,940.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE 750M
250-1360 DOZER WIDE TRACK 96-105 HP CAB JOHN DEERE 650K or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER 96-105 HP

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 81
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531

1.3  D6K XL CAT, JOHN DEERE 700J OR 
EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
HORSEPOWER

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
1.4  D7K XL CAT OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
HORSEPOWER

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
RENTAL LOCATIONS 
1.5  D8K XL CAT OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
HORSEPOWER

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

BULLDOZER RENTAL
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
1.6  D9K XL CAT OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $748.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,008.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $4,593.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
150-2770 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH 84IN SNG 11 TON VOLVO SD115B or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER Variable

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 172
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531

2.1 MINI - CAT 301, KOBELCO SK135, KUBOTA 
U35-4R1  OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $330.00 $341.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $999.00 $930.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,200.00 $1,947.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL HITACHI ZX35U-5N/CASE CX37C
240-1200 MINI-EXCAVATOR 4000-4999 LBS DSL ROPS BOBCAT E20 or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER Variable
OPERATING WEIGHT 4000-4999 LBS
DIGGING DEPTH Variable
MAXIMUM REACH Variable

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 110
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
OPTIONS:

Boom Jackhammer No Bid No Bid 
2.2 SMALL - CAT 312C, KOBELCO SK160 OR 
EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $830.00 $880.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,225.00 $2,162.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $5,500.00 $5,775.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE CX130D/HITACHI ZX130
240-2000 EXCAVATOR 28000-38000 LBS STD REACH VOLVO EC140EL or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER Variable
OPERATING WEIGHT 28000-38000 LBS
DIGGING DEPTH Standard
MAXIMUM REACH Standard

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 135
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
OPTIONS:

Boom Jackhammer No Bid No Bid 
2.3 MEDIUM - CAT 320C, KOBELCO SK210 OR 
EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,325.00 $1,084.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $3,400.00 $2,739.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $7,800.00 $7,051.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE CX220E/HITACHI ZX210
240-2200 EXCAVATOR 43000-49999 LBS STD REACH VOLVO EC200EL or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER Variable
OPERATING WEIGHT 43000-49999 LBS
DIGGING DEPTH Standard
MAXIMUM REACH Standard

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 162

    

No Bid 

TRACK HOE/ EXCAVATOR RENTAL 
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
2.4 MEDIUM WITH BOOM JACK HAMMER - CAT 
320C, KOBELCO SK210, DOOSAN DX180 OR 
EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
HORSEPOWER
OPERATING WEIGHT
DIGGING DEPTH
MAXIMUM REACH

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
2.5 LARGE - CAT 324E OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,185.00 $1,848.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $3,100.00 $4,389.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $7,500.00 $12,100.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE CX250D/HITACHI ZX250
240-2400 EXCAVATOR 60000-69999 LBS STD REACH VOLVO EC300EL or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER Variable
OPERATING WEIGHT 60000-69999 LBS
DIGGING DEPTH Standard
MAXIMUM REACH Standard

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 8
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
2.6 LARGE - CAT 329 OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,335.00 $1,848.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $3,500.00 $4,389.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $8,300.00 $12,100.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE CX300E/HITACHI ZX300
240-2500 EXCAVATOR 70000-80000 LBS STD REACH VOLVO EC350EL or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER Variable
OPERATING WEIGHT 70000-80000 LBS
DIGGING DEPTH Standard
MAXIMUM REACH Standard

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 122
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

3.1  20-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.2  30-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

CRANE RENTAL
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.3  75-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.4  80-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.5  110-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.6  120-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.7  160-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR

  

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

  

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.8  200-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.9  250-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.10  300-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.11  350-TON MOTOR CRANE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
3.12 - OTHER SIZES AVAILABLE
PRICE PER HOUR WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER HOUR WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR

No Bid 

No Bid 

  

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

  

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

4.1  84 "SINGLE DRUM CAT CP56C, HAMM 3410 
OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $650.00 $930.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,950.00 $2,450.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $4,499.00 $5,575.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE SV211E
150-2600 ROLLER RIDE-ON PADFT 84IN SNG 11 TON VOLVO SD115B or 

Equivalent
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM SINGLE Single
DRUM WIDTH 84" 84 Inches
HORSEPOWER Variable

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 21
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
4.2  66" SINGLE DRUM CAT CP433, HAMM 3307 
OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $499.00 $803.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,400.00 $2,101.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $3,500.00 $4,371.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE SV207E
150-2580 ROLLER RIDE-ON PADFT 66IN SNG 8 TON CATERPILLA CP44B 

or Equivalent
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM Single
DRUM WIDTH 66 Inches
HORSEPOWER Variable

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 8
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

5.1  84 "SINGLE DRUM CAT CS56C, HAMM 3410 
OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $630.00 $748.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,900.00 $2,008.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $4,500.00 $4,593.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
150-2770 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH 84IN SNG 11 TON VOLVO SD115B or 

Equivalent
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM CASE SV211E Single
DRUM WIDTH 84 Inches
HORSEPOWER Variable

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 172
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
5.2  66" SINGLE DRUM CAT CS433, HAMM 3307 
OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $499.00 $655.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,425.00 $1,678.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $3,500.00 $3,586.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE SV207E
150-2760 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH 66IN SNG 8 TON VOLVO SD75B or 

Equivalent
SINGLE OR DUAL DRUM Single
DRUM WIDTH 66 Inches
HORSEPOWER Variable

  

SELF PROPELLED FLAT-WHEELED (SMOOTH) ROLLER

SELF PROPELLED VIBRATORY SHEEPSFOOT (PADFOOT) ROLLER
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 162
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
SINGLE OR DUAL
WIDTH OF CUT (MAXIMUM)
DEPTH OF CUT
HORSEPOWER
OPERATING WEIGHT

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,500.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $3,477.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $8,693.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL LEEBOY 7000C
PAVING WIDTH

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
HOPPER CAPACITY
HORSEPOWER
OPERATING WEIGHT
CUTTING WIDTH
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,300.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $6,500.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $13,500.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL GRADALL XL3100
BUCKET CAPACITY
MAX TELESCOPING BOOM LENGTH
MIN TELESCOPING BOOM LENGTH
TELESCOPING BOOM TRAVEL
HORSEPOWER
OPERATING WEIGHT

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $995.00 $1,353.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,599.00 $3,641.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $5,700.00 $9,900.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A
NUMBER OF WHEELS Variable
HORSEPOWER 130-139 HP
OPERATING WEIGHT Variable

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE PT240D 260-1120 ROAD GRADER 130-139HP DSL John Deere 670G or Equivalent

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 11
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
HIGH SPEED ROTARY MIXER FOR LIMING OPERATIONS

ASPHALT PAVER - 10' TO 12' WIDTH

TELESCOPIC BOOM EXCAVATING & GRADING MACHINE

PNEMATIC TIRED ROLLER 
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com

10.1 NORAM 65E OR EQUIVALENT
Must meet the following minimum specifications:  operating 
weight 18,500 lbs., 68 HP, 10’ blade.
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,175.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,600.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $7,900.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
HORSEPOWER
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL LEEBOY 695
SIZE BLADE
OPERATING WEIGHT
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
OPTIONS:

12' BLADE

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
RENTAL LOCATIONS 
10.2 CAT 12H, JOHN DEERE 672D OR 
EQUIVALENT
Must meet the following minimum specifications:  operating 
weight 31,000 lbs., 140 HP, 12’ blade.
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR
HORSEPOWER
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
SIZE BLADE
OPERATING WEIGHT
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
RENTAL LOCATIONS
OPTIONS:

14' BLADE

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

12.1 - 6 CUBIC FOOT
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
12.2 - 9 CUBIC FOOT
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

13.1 HAND HELD, ELECTRIC
PRICE PER DAY $94.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $314.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $666.00 

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
100-2730 CONCRETE CUTOFF SAW 14IN HAND HELD GAS HILTI DSH 700-

X or Equivalent

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1035
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

MOTOR GRADER

COMPACTOR RENTAL, VIBRATING 21 X 19 " PLATE (PLATE TAMPS)

CEMENT MIXEX, GAS OPERATED, TOWABLE

CONCRETE SAW
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
OPTIONS:      

PER EACH Negotiable     
PER EACH Negotiable

13.2 WALK BEHIND
PRICE PER DAY $253.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $715.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $1,265.00 
HORSEPOWER Variable

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
280-1020 TRENCHER W/B TRACK 24IN GAS BARRETO E1624STKB-4S or 

Equivalent

NUMBER OF MACHINES AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 147
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
OPTIONS:      

PER EACH Negotiable     
PER EACH Negotiable

PRICE PER DAY $77.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $270.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $567.00 
HORSEPOWER 2 HP

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 100-2120 CONCRETE VIBRATOR 2HP ELEC WACKER M2500 or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 585
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

PRICE PER DAY $154.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $567.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $1,128.00 
GAS OR ELECTRIC Electric

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
100-4230 GRINDER CONRETE FLOOR 9-11IN SINGLE 115V HUSQVARNA 

PG280 or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 236
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A
DELIVERY FEE $225 EACH WAY
OPTIONS:

GRINDING STONES (SET OF 6), 2"x 2"x 4", cost per set Negotiable

PRICE PER DAY $55.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $187.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $363.00 
ELECTRIC OR AIR Air

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
120-1520 CHIPPING HAMMER RETAINER 13-20 LB AIR APT 264 or 

Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 631
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
OPTIONS:

POINTED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable
CHISELED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable

PRICE PER DAY $52.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $182.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $380.00 
ELECTRIC OR AIR Air
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 120-1610 BREAKER 20-39LB AIR APT 117 or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 281
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
OPTIONS:

POINTED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable
CHISELED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable

18.1 - 35 LB.
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ELECTRIC OR AIR
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

No Bid No Bid 

  

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

SURFACE GRINDER (TERRAZZO GRINDER)

CHIPPING HAMMMER 15 LB.

DEMOLITION HAMMBER 30 LB.

JACK HAMMER 

CONCRETE VIBRATOR 1", 1 3/8", 2" SHAFT HEAD
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
OPTIONS:

POINTED BITS,  cost per each
CHISELED BITS,  cost per each

18.2 - 60 LB.
PRICE PER DAY $64.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $215.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $462.00 
ELECTRIC OR AIR Air
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 120-1640 BREAKER 60-79LB AIR APT 160 or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 702
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
OPTIONS:

POINTED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable
CHISELED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable

18.3 - 90 LB.
PRICE PER DAY $77.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $275.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $572.00 
ELECTRIC OR AIR Air
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 120-1660 BREAKER 80-99LB AIR APT 190 or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 698
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A
DELIVERY FEE $225 EACH WAY
OPTIONS:

POINTED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable
CHISELED BITS,  cost per each Negotiable

19.1 -  45' OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY $500.00 $407.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,100.00 $897.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,200.00 $2,140.00 
BOOM LENGTH 45 Feet

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL GENIE Z-45 410-3120 BOOM ARTICULATED 45FT JIB 4WD DSL JLG 450AJ or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1067
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
19.2 -  60' OR EQUIVALENT, 500 - 1000 LB. 
CAPACITY
PRICE PER DAY $600.00 $512.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,300.00 $1,155.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,450.00 $2,805.00 
BOOM LENGTH 60 Feet

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL GENIE Z-62 410-3200 BOOM ARTICULATED 60FT JIB 4WD DSL JLG 600AJ or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 514
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
19.3 - 80' OR EQUIVALENT, 500-1000 LB 
CAPACITY 
PRICE PER DAY 900 $935.00
PRICE PER WEEK 2125 $2,123.00
PRICE PER MONTH 4400 $4,675.00
BOOM LENGTH 80 Feet

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL JLG 800AJ 410-3300 BOOM ARTICULATED 80FT JIB 4WD DSL JLG 800AJ or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 506
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

PRICE PER DAY $121.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $424.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $880.00 
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 115-2490 POSTHOLE AUGER ONE MAN GAS STIHL BT131 or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 125
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

21.1 -  2"
PRICE PER DAY $110.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $342.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $764.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

    

No Bid 

No Bid 

POST HOLE AUGER - ONE MAN, AUGER BIT 10"WIDE 36" DEEP

WATER PUMP, PORTABLE (INCLUDE 20FT SUCTION HOSE, 50 FT DISCHARGE HOSE AND STRAINER)

MAN LIFT, ARTICULATING BOOM
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
21.2 -  3"
PRICE PER DAY $128.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $432.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $940.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
21.3 - 4"
PRICE PER DAY $320.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $937.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,271.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
21.4 -  6"
PRICE PER DAY $421.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,167.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,963.00 
GASOLINE OR AIR Diesel

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
801-1240 PUMP VAC ASSIST 6IN DSL PIONEER 66S12-HRC-01-D or 

Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 534
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
OPTIONS:

ADDITIONAL 20 FT. SUCTION 
HOSE,  add per day Negotiable
ADDITIONAL 50 FT. DISCHARGE 
HOSE,  add per day Negotiable

22.1 -  2" (SINK) WITH 50' HOSE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
22.2 - 4" (MAIN LINE) WITH 100' HOSE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
22.3 -  6" WITH 100' HOSE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

23.1 WALK BEHIND, SELF PROPELLED
23.1.1 - 1' DEEP, 2" WIDE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
23.1.2 - 2' DEEP, 4" WIDE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
23.1.3 - 2' DEEP, 6" WIDE
PRICE PER DAY $253.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $715.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $1,265.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
23.2 RIDE ON 
23.2.1 - 3-4' DEEP, 6" WIDE
PRICE PER DAY $468.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,188.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,580.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

No Bid 

No Bid 

  

No Bid 

No Bid 

SEWER AUGER RENTAL

TRENCHER
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
23.2.2 - 3-4' DEEP, 8" WIDE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE
23.2.3 - 3-4' DEEP, 10" WIDE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
23.2.4 4' DEEP, 12" WIDE
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $450.00 $358.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,075.00 $858.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,200.00 $1,909.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE SR240B
200-1370 SKIDSTEER LOADER 2400-2999LB ROPS BOBCAT S650 or 

Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 35
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
24.1 SKID STEER LOADER
BOBCAT T590 OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY WITHOUT OPERATOR $400.00 $402.00 
PRICE PER WEEK WITHOUT OPERATOR $1,200.00 $1,062.00 
PRICE PER MONTH WITHOUT OPERATOR $2,800.00 $2,668.00 
PRICE PER DAY WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER WEEK WITH OPERATOR N/A
PRICE PER MONTH WITH OPERATOR N/A

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL CASE TR270B
200-1450 COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2000-2399LB ROPS BOBCAT T595 or 

Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1068
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

25.1 AUGER 12" BIT
PRICE PER DAY $41.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $145.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $327.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
25.2 AUGER 16" BIT
PRICE PER DAY $42.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $149.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $330.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
25.3 AUGER 18" BIT
PRICE PER DAY $45.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $162.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $338.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
25.4 AUGER 24" BIT
PRICE PER DAY $52.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $165.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $389.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
25.5 AUGER 36" BIT
PRICE PER DAY $74.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $232.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $551.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

No Bid 

No Bid 

  

SKID STEER LOADER ATTACHMENTS

SKID STEER LOADER BOBCAT S175, CAT 22652 OR EQUIVALENT
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
25.6 CEMENT BREAKER 500 LB. HYDRAULIC 
DEMO HAMMER
PRICE PER DAY $350.00 $248.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,000.00 $710.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,300.00 $1,535.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
25.7 SWEEPER 6 FT.
PRICE PER DAY $375.00 $132.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $999.00 $407.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,400.00 $847.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
25.8 FORK LIFT
PRICE PER DAY $399.00 $105.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $815.00 $293.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $1,600.00 $666.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

26.1 - 100 CFM
PRICE PER DAY $143.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $319.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $715.00 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
26.2 - 185 CFM
PRICE PER DAY $350.00 $171.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $615.00 $363.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $915.00 $853.00 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
26.3 - 250 CFM
PRICE PER DAY $336.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $798.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $1,925.00 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
26.4 -  375 CFM
PRICE PER DAY $315.00 $336.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $899.00 $798.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $1,999.00 $1,925.00 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
26.5 -  750 CFM
PRICE PER DAY $655.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,799.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $3,685.00 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
26.6 - 1300 CFM
PRICE PER DAY $1,375.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $3,377.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $8,703.00 

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
140-1480 COMPRESSOR TOWABLE INS QUAL 1600CFM DSL DOOSAN 

HP1600WCU-T4F-I or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 146

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

27.1 PORTABLE LIGHT CART WITH TWO 500 
WATT BULBS
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
DELIVERY FEE
27.2 TOWER LIGHTS
27.2.1 - 10' HEIGHT, ONE 1,000 WATT BULB
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
DELIVERY FEE
27.2.2 - 15' HEIGHT, TWO 1,000 WATT BULBS, 
3000 WATT GENERATOR
PRICE PER DAY $108.00 

No Bid No Bid 

  

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

AIR COMPRESSOR 

PORTABLE LIGHTS
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
PRICE PER WEEK $286.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $743.00 

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
27.3 TOWABLE LIGHT PLANTS
30' HEIGHT, FOUR 1,000 WATT BULBS, 5000 
WATT GENERATOR
PRICE PER DAY $165.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $315.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $715.00 
DELIVERY FEE

28.1 -  40FT WORKING HEIGHT
lift capacity ANSI, CSA of 500 lbs.
PRICE PER DAY $399.00 $363.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,041.00 $897.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,400.00 $2,063.00 
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL JLG T350 410-1010 BOOM TOWABLE 35FT BATTERY JLG T350 or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 238
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
28.2 - 60FT WORKING HEIGHT
lift capacity ANSI, CSA of 500 lbs.
PRICE PER DAY $424.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,150.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,420.00 
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL 410-1010 BOOM TOWABLE 50FT BATTERY JLG T500J or Equivalent
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 188
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
28.3 80FT WORKING HEIGHT
lift capacity ANSI, CSA of 500 lbs.
PRICE PER DAY
PRICE PER WEEK
PRICE PER MONTH
YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE 
DELIVERY FEE

PRICE PER DAY $757.00 $935.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $2,100.00 $2,541.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $5,500.00 $6,600.00 

YEAR, MAKE AND MODEL HITACHI ZW180
265-1410 WHEEL LOADER 3.5-3.9 YD STD BKT DSL VOVO L90H or 

Equivalent
HORSEPOWER Variable
OPERATING WEIGHT Variable
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 59
RENTAL LOCATIONS 531 S Brazosport Blvd S, Clute, TX 77531
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

30.1 - 19' - GENIE GS1930 OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY $185.00 $138.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $315.00 $275.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $515.00 $468.00 
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 5560
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
30.2 - 26' - GENIE GS26 OR EQUIVALENT
PRICE PER DAY $225.00 $187.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $475.00 $385.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $825.00 $765.00 
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1944
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
30.3 - 10-13 Ft. Electric, Narrow 
PRICE PER DAY $165.00 $138.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $295.00 $275.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $445.00 $468.00 
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 446
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

No Bid 

No Bid 

  

No Bid 

SCISSOR LIFT

TOWABLE DIESEL GENERATOR

TRAILER MOUNTED BOOM / MAN LIFT 

WHEEL LOADER
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
31.1 - 20-25 KW

PRICE PER DAY

248.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

PRICE PER WEEK

545.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

PRICE PER MONTH

1276.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

1910.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
31.2 - 50 KW

PRICE PER DAY

358.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

PRICE PER WEEK

864.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

PRICE PER MONTH

2299.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

955.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
31.3 - 150 KW

PRICE PER DAY

748.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

PRICE PER WEEK

1991.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

PRICE PER MONTH

4400.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).

NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE

223.00-Rates are quoted in single shift (8 hours). Double shift is billed at 1.5 
times quoted rate (8-16 hours). Triple shift is billed at 2 times quoted rate (16-24 

hours).
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

PRICE PER DAY $215.00
PRICE PER WEEK $726.00
PRICE PER MONTH $1,485.00
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 375
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

PRICE PER DAY 199 $160.00
PRICE PER WEEK 360 $308.00
PRICE PER MONTH 525 $539.00
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1564
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

PRICE PER DAY $475.00 $407.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,100.00 $1,045.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,300.00 $2,255.00 
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 1166
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
33.1 35-39 FT. 6,000 LB
PRICE PER DAY $484.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,161.00 
PRICE PER MONTH $2,613.00 
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 814
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.

PRICE PER DAY $561.00 
PRICE PER WEEK $1,414.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

BRUSH CHIPPER, 9 IN. GAS POWERED

PRESSURE WASHER, 3000 PSI, ON TRAILER

ONE PERSON PUSHAROUND LIFT, ELECTRIC

TELEHANDLER, 16-20 FT. 5,000 LB.
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ITB #25-55 EQUIPEMENT RENTAL 

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME Associated Supply Company, Inc. Herc Rentals Inc. 
TUESDAY, AUGUST 12, 2025 @ 11AM ADDRESS 6203 Long Dr. Houston, Texas 27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Bonita Springs Florida
LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Timothy Gates Michael Carter
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-627-5148 979-292-6169
ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL: tgates@ascoeq.com hercbids@hercrentals.com
PRICE PER MONTH $3,410.00 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE N/A

DELIVERY FEE
$225 EACH WAY-Outside Hauling and After Hours Delivery are negotiated 

locally, Tolls and Permits are not included.
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE FOR COUNTY USE 212

CATEGORY: DISCOUNT (% FROM PUBLISHED / BOOK RATE)
36.1 ACCESSORIES 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.2 AERIAL EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.3 AIR MOVING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.4 EARTH MOVING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.5 COMPACTION EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.6 COMPRESSORS 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.7 CONCRETE AND MASONRY EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.8 COOLING AND HEATING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.9 CRANES 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.10 DEMOLITION EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.11 DRILL EQUIPMENT AND TOOLS 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.12 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.13 FORKLIFTS AND ACCESSORIES 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.14 REFUSE TRUCKS 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.15 GENERATORS 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.16 LANDSCAPING 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.17 LIGHTING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.18 PAINTING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.19 PUMPS AND ACCESSORIES 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.20 SAWS AND ACCESSORIES 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.21 SHOP EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.22 TRENCHING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.23 VEHICLES AND TRAILERS 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.24 WASHING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.25 WELDING EQUIPMENT 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change
36.26 MISCELLANEOUS 5%-Book Rates are Subject to Change

  

No Bid 
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