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Proposed Price % of Increase

$9.34 8%

46.44 8%

12.582 8%

9.342 8%

46.44 8%

12.582 8%

46.44 8%

9.342 8%

196.4736 8%

46.44 8%

9.342 8%

ATTACHMENT A - BID TABLE
ITB# 23-68 DISASTER LANDFILL SERVICES

Note:  All quoted rates must include the TCEQ fee and any other fees and surcharges.

Bidder must supply pricing by the TON and Cubic Yard(CY) where applicable.

C&D waste: Pricing

Disposal rate (CY) – Large truck – reduced $11.65

Disposal rate per cubic yard $8.65

Disposal rate (TON) $43.00

Disposal rate (CY) – Large truck – reduced $11.65

Non-compacted brush:

Disposal rate per cubic yard $8.65

Disposal rate (TON) $43.00

Disposal rate (CY) $8.65

Animal carcass waste:

Disposal rate (TON) $43.00

Disposal rate (CY) $8.65

Burial fee (if applicable) $181.92

Disposal fee (if applicable) N/A

Municipal solid waste:

Disposal rate (TON) $43.00

Electronic waste:

Disposal rate (TON) No Bid



Name of landfill:
Address:

Type:

List available locations in Brazoria County and surrounding Counties, as well as Landfill type:

Disposal rate (CY) No Bid

Household hazardous waste:

Disposal rate (TON) No Bid

Disposal rate (CY) No Bid

Seabreeze
10310 FM 523
Angleton Tx 77515
Type Class 1
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