
OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME

Wednesday, May 27, 2026 ADDRESS

LOCATION:

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY:

237 E. Locust Street Suite 406 TELEPHONE NUMBER:

ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL:

QTY UOM
UNIT PRICER 
PER GALLON/ 

BAG

EXTENDED 
PRICE

PROVIDEMIX 
RATIO VENDOR PRODUCT NAME DAYS TO DELIVER 

ARO

UNIT PRICER 
PER GALLON/ 

BAG
EXTENDED PRICE PROVIDEMIX 

RATIO
VENDOR PRODUCT 

NAME
DAYS TO DELIVER 

ARO

UNIT PRICER 
PER GALLON/ 

BAG

EXTENDED 
PRICE PROVIDEMIX RATIO VENDOR PRODUCT NAME DAYS TO DELIVER 

ARO

30 DRUM $67.10 2,013.00/
Drum Ranges

PermaSease 30-
30 2-5 Days ARO

84.60/GL 2,538.00 
/Drum Varies Permanone 30-30

1-3 Days 
ARO

$79.97
2399.1 1-5 or more

Materline Kontrol 30-
30 3-7 Days

30 DRUM
131.49 /GL

3,944.70/
Drum Ranges 

PermaSease 31-
67 2-5 Days ARO 148.50 /GL

4,455.00 
Drum Varies Perm-X-UL 31-66

1-3 Days 
ARO 

0 BULK 70.75 Neat Fyfanon ULV 3-7 Days 

30 DRUM 325.04/GL
9,751.20/
Drum Neat 

Dibrom 
Concentrate 2-5 Days ARO

YES

2.5 CAN 39.44/GL 98.60 /Jug 16 Oz/Acre 
Vecobac 12AS 
2x2.5 GL 2-5 Days ARO 37.00 /GL 92.50/Can Varies Fallout LQ 

1-3 Days 
ARO 

2.5 CAN

5 CAN 25.95 /GL 
129.75 
/Pail Neat BVA 2 2-5 Days ARO 24.00 / GL 120.00/Can Undiluted BV-2 Lavicide Oil 

1-3 Days 
ARO 

55 DRUM 24.49/GL
1,346.95/
Drum Neat BVA 2 2-5 Days ARO 22.00 / GL 

1,210.00/ 
Drum Undiluted BV-2 Lavicide Oil 

1-3 Days 
ARO 26.44 1454.55 RTU BVA 3-10 Days 

CASE 893.20/CS 893.20 undiluted 
Altosid XR Slim 
Ingot 1-3 Days ARO 893.20 893.20 RTU Central Life Sciences 3-7 Days 

40 LBS BAG 32.50/LB 1,300.00/Ba  Ranges Metalarv S-PT 2-5 Days ARO 834.00 Bag 834.00 / Bag undiluted Altosid P35 1-3 Days ARO 834.00 834.00 2-10 #per acre Central Life Sciences 3-7 Days 

40 LBS BAG 424.00 Bag 424.00/ Bag undiluted Altosid XR-G
1-3 Days 

ARO 424.00 434.00 5-10 #per acre Central Life Sciences 3-7 Days 10. ALTOSID XR -G NO BID 
 (Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were $0.00)

9.0 METALARV SPHERICAL PELLET
 (Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were $0.00)

8.0 METHOPRENE EXTENDED RESIDUAL BRIQUET - 
"INGOT DESIGN" ALTOSID XR EXTENDED RESIDUAL 
BRIQUET "INGOT DESIGN" - CASE (Estimated annual NO BID 
 (Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were $109,538.00)

55 GALLON CONTAINER
 (Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were $0.00)

7.0 BVA 2 MOSQUITO LARVICIDE OIL - 2.5 GALLON 
CONTAINER                                        NO BID NO BID NO BID 

5 GALLON NO BID 

6.0 B.T.I. BACILLUS THURINGIENSIS, SEROTYPE H-14 -2.5 
GALLON CONTAINER                                                                                          
(Estimated annual expenditures for 2020 were: $300.00) NO BID
(Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were: $0.00)

( Does vendor retrieve containers after use? YES OR NO 

5.0 NALED - 30 GALLON DRUM                                                 NO BID NO BID
(Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were: $177,372)

4.0 MALATHION - BULK PRICE                                                  NO BID NO BID 
  (Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were: $245,995.00)

3.0 PERMETHRIN 31-67 CONCENTRATE - 30 GALLON 
CONTAINER NO BID
(Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were: $0.00)

DESCRIPTION

2.0 PERMETHRIN 30-30 CONCENTRATE - 30 GALLON 
CONTAINER 
(Estimated annual expenditures for 2025 were: $18,262.00)

aes.vectorbids@azelis.com kirsti.rodney@target-specialty.com keith.Haas@veseris.com

ATTACHMENT A - BID TABLE 

Andy Pierce Kirsti Rodney Keith Haas 

407-328-6519 225-999-8307 713-203-0436

100 Colonial Center Parkway, Ste 170 11301 Industriplex Blvd. Ste 100 10800 Pecan Park Blvd Suite 300

Lake Mary, FL Baton Rouge, LA Austin, TX 

BID TABULATION

ITB #26-50 Mosquito Control Chemicals

ADAPCO LLC Rentokil North America Inc., dba Target Specialty Products ES OpCO USA LLC dba Veseries
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	Bid Tabulation

