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ITB#26-24 WASTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES

PORT-A-CANS - BID TABULATION

UNITED SITE SERVICES

TEXLA RENTAL SERVICE

SUPERIOR WASTE

DESCRIPTION

County ID

Qty

Day of Service

Price per EA
per Month

Ext Price per
Month

Day of Service

Price per EA
per Month

Ext Price per
Month

Day of Service

Price per EA
per Month

Ext Price per
Month

PORT-A-CANS

Port-a Can County Beach Follets
4/11-9/19, 2 x week

Parks Dept, Bluewater Hwy - CR257
(btwn beach access roads 1 &2)

2401

Monday & Friday

$160.00

$1,600.00

Monday & Friday

$180.00

$1,800.00

Monday & Friday

$225.00

$2,250.00

Port-a Can County Beach Quintana
3/10-5/11, 1 x week

Parks Dept, 330 5th St (fishing pier)
Quintana

6604

Monday

$125.00

$125.00

Monday

$125.00

$125.00

Monday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can County Beach Quintana
9/12-3/9, 1 x week

Qty 1 @ Main Entrance

Qty 1 @ Fishing Pier

Parks Dept, 330 5th St, Quintana

2402

Monday
(OFF SEASON)

$125.00

$250.00

Monday
(OFF SEASON)

$125.00

$250.00

Monday
(OFF SEASON)

$115.00

$230.00

Port-a Can County Beach Quintana
5/11-9/11, 2 x week

Qty 1 @ Main Entrance

Qty 1 @ Fishing Pier

Parks Dept 330 5th St, Quintana

2403

Monday & Friday
(PEAK SEASON)

$160.00

$320.00

Monday & Friday
(PEAK SEASON)

$180.00

$360.00

Monday & Friday
(PEAK SEASON)

$225.00

$450.00

Port-a Can Surfside Barn, Year Round,1 x week
Parks Dept 2214 Fort Velasco, Surfside

2406

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Sportman's Span, Year
Round, 1 x Week
Parks Dept, 3655 FM 2611 Brazoria

2407

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp McNeil Bridge, Year
Round, 1 x Week
Parks Dept, 3204 FM 521, Brazoria

2408

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp End of Levee Road, Year
Round, 1 x Week
Parks Dept, 4114 E Flood Gate Rd,Freeport

2409

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Sonny Travis, Year Round,
1 x week
Parks Dept, 2101 Hwy 36, Freeport

2410

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Seidlers, Year Round, 1 x
Week
Parks Dept, 5311 1/3 Amigo Ln, Freeport

2411

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Swan Lake, Year Round, 1
x week
Parks Dept, 8311 1/3 Bay St, Surfside

2412

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp San Luis Pass, Year
Round, 1 x week
Parks Dept, 14001 CR 257, Freeport

2413

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Port-a Can Boat Ramp,Chocolate Bayou,Year
Round, 1 x week
Parks Dept, 17703 1/3 FM 2004 RD,Liverpool

2430

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00

Friday

$125.00

$125.00
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Port-a Can Precinct 1 Clute Service Center, As

Needed 1 x week $1250 $1250

1432 Highland Park(any location in Pct 1) 2415 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 +$50 delivery

Port-a Can Precinct 1 Clute Service Center, As

Needed 2 x week $2251

1432 Highland Park(any locatin in Pct 1) 2416 $160.00 $160.00 $180.00 $180.00 +$50 delivery $225.00

Port-a Can Precinct 2 Angleton Service Center,

As Needed 1 x week $12510

21017 CR 171 (any location in Pct 2) 2417 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 +$50 delivery $125.00

Port-a Can Precinct 2 Angleton Service Center,

As Needed 2 x week $2250

21017 CR 171 (any location in Pct 2) 2418 $160.00 $160.00 $180.00 $180.00 +$50 delivery $225.00

Port-a Can Precinct 3 Alvin Service Center, As

Needed 1 x week $12510

2508 N Gordon (any location in Pct 3) 2419 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 +$50 delivery $125.00

Port-a Can Precinct 3 Alvin Service Center, As

Needed 2 x week $2251

2508 N Gordon (any location in Pct 3) 2420 $160.00 $160.00 $180.00 $180.00 +$50 delivery $225.00

Port-a Can Precinct 4 Brazoria Service Center, As

Needed 1 x week $1250

1001 Market St (any location in Pct 4) 2421 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 +$50 delivery $125.00

Port-a Can Precinct 4 Brazoria Service Center, As

Needed 2 x week $2250

1001 Market St (any location in Pct 4) 2422 $160.00 $160.00 $180.00 $180.00 +$50 delivery $225.00
$1250

Port-A-Can service 1 x per week 2423 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 +$50 delivery $125.00
$2250

Port-A-Can service 2 x per week 2424 $160.00 $160.00 $180.00 $180.00 +$50 delivery $225.00
$3300

Port-A-Can service 3 x per week 2425 $195.00 $195.00 $240.00 $240.00 +$50 delivery $330.00
$4000

Port-A-Can service 4 x per week 2426 $230.00 $230.00 $290.00 $290.00 +$50 delivery $400.00
$5000

Port-A-Can service 5 x per week 2427 $265.00 $265.00 $340.00 $340.00 +$50 delivery $500.00
$6750

Port-A-Can service 6 x per week 2428 $300.00 $300.00 $390.00 $390.00 +$50 delivery $675.00
$79510

Port-A-Can service Daily 2429 $335.00 $335.00 $475.00 $475.00 +50 delivery $795.00
$8500

Port-A-Can service, Handicap, Daily 9709 $335.00 $335.00 $500.00 $500.00 +$50 delivery $850.00
$1750

Port-A-Can service, Handicap,1 x week 7644 $125.00 $125.00 $150.00 $150.00 +$50 delivery $175.00
$35510

Port-A-Can service, Handicap, 2 x week 7644 $160.00 $160.00 $200.00 $200.00 +$50 delivery $355.00
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Can Can Port-A- Port-A- | Port-A-
Service | Service Can Port-A-Can Can Can
1x 2x Service 1 | Service 2 x Service 1 [Service 2
EMERGENCY DISASTER AS NEEDED Week | Week Haul Rate x Week Week Haul Rate x Week | x Week Haul Rate
40 Yard Roll-off, for emergency disaster, as $1500 $3000
needed (INCLUDES 5 PORT-A-CANS) 9652 1 Lot | NO BID | NO BID NO BID $2,075.00 | $2,400.00 $200.00 +$50 del +$50 del $625.00
*Port-A-Cans delivered on trailer for emergency $3450 +$100
disaster as needed 2545 1 Lot | NOBID|NO BID NO BID $2,075.00 | $2,400.00 $200.00 +$100 del del $625.00
40 Yard Roll-off filled with Port-A-Cans, for $1500 $3000
emergency disaster, as needed 9653 1 Lot | NOBID|NO BID NO BID $2,075.00 | $2,400.00 $200.00 +50 del | +$50 del $625.00
TOTALS (If Applicable) N/A N/A N/A

DATE PRINTED 3/31/2026




	Attachment A Bid Table

